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BID TABULATION

2010 STOCKPILE BID

Colebrookdale Township

June 21, 2010
11:00 AM
Bidder









     Item







Unit Price(+)
        $             
Pick Up 

Unit Price(+)
     $          





















     Pick Up
  




Location

Delivered







Bechtelsville Asphalt
 
 
  
15 Tons Permanent Cold Patch



    No Bid
Div. of Haines & Kibblehouse, Inc.
20 Tons 486 Stockpile Cold Patch


    No Bid
1355 N Reading Avenue


200 Tons Superpave (Mixture A) *


$54.79/ton

$10,958.00

Bechtelsville
$58.99


$11,798.00



Bechtelsville, PA 19505
     


200 Tons Superpave (Mixture B) **


  46.94/ton

    9,388.00

Bechtelsville
  51.14


  10,228.00











200 Tons Superpave (Mixture C) ***


  50.92/ton

  10,184.00

Bechtelsville
  55.12


  11,024.00










200 Gallons PG 64-22





    No Bid





 
Sanatoga Quarry




15 Tons Permanent Cold Patch

   

$82.00/ton

$ 1,230.00

Sanatoga

$85.50


$ 1,282.50


Division of Reading Materials, Inc.
20 Tons 486 Stockpile Cold Patch
   

  95.00/ton

   1,900.00

Sanatoga

  98.50


   1,970.00










200 Tons Superpave (Mixture A) *
    

    No Bid









200 Tons Superpave (Mixture B) **
   

    No Bid









200 Tons Superpave (Mixture C) ***
   

    No Bid









200 Gallons PG 64-22



   

    No Bid
Eastern Industries Inc.



15 Tons Permanent Cold Patch

    

$99.00/ton

$ 1,485.00

Oley


----------


-------------


4401 Camp Meeting Rd



20 Tons 486 Stockpile Cold Patch
  

    No Bid

Suite 200






200 Tons Superpave (Mixture A) *
   

  53.00/ton

 10,600.00

Oley


----------


-------------
Center Valley, PA  19612


200 Tons Superpave (Mixture B) **
    

  43.75/ton

   8,750.00

Oley


----------


-------------










200 Tons Superpave (Mixture C) ***
    

  47.25/ton

   9,450.00

Oley


----------


-------------









200 Gallons PG 64-22



    

    No Bid
I hereby certify that this is a true and correct tabulation of all bids received for the 2010 Stockpile Bid.  Bids opened and read June 21, 2010, 11:00 AM.






_____________________________________






Jeannie DiSante





Township Secretary
(+) Mileage factor of $0.90 per ton per mile and per gal. per mile will be used to determine the low bidder.  
*Mixture A - Superpave Asphalt Mixture Design 9.5 mm, PG 64-22, Wearing Course, 0.0 to 0.3 Million ESAL’s.
**Mixture B - Superpave Asphalt Mixture Design 25 mm, PG 64-22, Wearing Course, 0.0 to 0.3 Million ESAL’s.
***Mixture C - Superpave Asphalt Mixture Design 19 mm, PG 64-22, Wearing Course, 0.0 to 0.3 Million ESAL’s.
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2010 Mileage Factor Calculations Stockpile Bids 










Tons

Miles

Mileage Factor


 Bechtelsville Asphalt







 $0.90 
X
  15

X
     3
=
 $     40.50 

 $0.90 
X
  20

X
     3
=
        54.00 

 $0.90 
X
200

X
     3
=
      540.00 

 $0.90 
X
400

X
     3
=
   1,080.00 

Sanatoga Quarries







 $0.90 
X
  15

X
  9.7
=
 $   130.95 

 $0.90 
X
  20

X
  9.7
=
      174.60 

 $0.90 
X
200

X
  9.7
=
   1,746.00 

 $0.90 
X
400

X
  9.7
=
   3,492.00 
Eastern Industries, Inc







 $0.90 
X
  15

X
12.8
=
 $   172.80 

 $0.90 
X
  20

X
12.8
=
      230.40 

 $0.90 
X
200

X
12.8
=
   2,304.00 

 $0.90 
X
400

X
12.8
=
   4,608.00 



Tons

Mileage Factor





 Bechtelsville Asphalt - Pick Up







 $   
X
  15

+
 $   


=
$     
 $  
X
  20

+
 $


=
       

 $ 54.79
X
200

+
 $   540.00   =
  11,498.00
 $ 46.94
X
200

+
 $   540.00   =
    9,928.00
 $ 50.92
X
200

+
 $   540.00   =
  10,724.00
Sanatoga Quarries - Pick Up
$ 82.00
X
  15 
+
 $   130.95
 =
$  1,360.95
$ 95.00
X
  20 
+
 $   174.60
 =
    2,174.60 

$   
X
200 
+
 $1,746.00
 =

$   
X
200

+
 $1,746.00
 =


$   
X
200 
+
 $
  -


Eastern Industries, Inc.







 $ 99.00
X
  15

+
 $   172.80   =
$  1,657.80
 $
X
  20

+
 $   230.40   =
   

 $ 53.00
X
200

+
 $2,304.00   =
  12,904.00
 $ 43.75
X
200

+
 $2,304.00   =
  11,054.00
 $ 47.25
X
200

+
 $2,304.00  
 =
  11,754.00    









